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Contact Suppliers Early: Reach out to your suppliers as soon 
as possible to secure inventory orders and confirm delivery 
timelines. Early communication ensures that you can adjust 
for potential delays in production or shipping, reducing the 
risk of stockouts during peak season. This proactive approach 
helps maintain a steady supply chain and supports demand 
forecasting.

3PL Discussions: Schedule a meeting with your 3PL provider 
to discuss your holiday fulfillment needs and assess their sea-
sonal staffing and capacity. This conversation should include 
setting expectations for order volumes, understanding their 
cut-off times for deliveries, and ensuring that they are fully 
equipped to handle your specific requirements. Building a 
strong relationship with your 3PL early can help mitigate 
potential challenges during the peak season

Peak Season Forecasting: Use sales data from previous years 
to forecast demand accurately, allowing you to better plan 
inventory needs and staffing. Sharing these forecasts with 
your fulfillment partners ensures that they are prepared to 
meet your specific demands. A data-driven approach can 
prevent stockouts, reduce excess inventory, and ensure 
smoother operations

Inventory Turnover Management: Assess your current inven-
tory levels and focus on clearing out slow-moving products to 
make room for high-demand items. By aligning your invento-
ry with peak season trends, you can avoid holding onto dead-
stock that ties up capital and warehouse space. Strategic 
inventory management is essential for maintaining cash flow 
and maximizing profitability during the holidays.

Secure Additional Storage Space: Evaluate your current 
warehouse space and secure additional storage if necessary. 
Peak season often requires increased inventory levels, and 
having the proper storage ensures that you can accommo-
date this influx without causing logistical bottlenecks. Renting 
extra space can also help prevent delays in fulfillment due to 
crowded conditions

Staff Training: Begin training your seasonal staff well in 
advance, ensuring they are familiar with your processes and 
ready to handle the busy holiday season. Cross-train your 
existing staff to cover multiple roles, which can increase flexi-
bility and reduce the risk of delays during peak times. Proper 
training helps maintain consistency in order fulfillment and 
customer service, even during high-volume periods

Test Shipping Automations: Implement and thoroughly test 
shipping automation tools, such as auto-label printing or rate 
calculators, to ensure smooth operations during peak times. 
These automations can significantly speed up the shipping 
process, reduce human errors, and help your business 
handle a higher volume of orders efficiently. Testing ahead of 
time allows you to identify and fix any issues before they 
impact peak season operations

Optimize Checkout Process: Ensure that your checkout pro-
cess is streamlined and optimized for the best customer 
experience. Tools like Easyship's Rates at Checkout provide 
accurate shipping options, improving transparency for cus-
tomers and reducing cart abandonment. A smooth checkout 
experience can increase conversion rates, especially during 
the competitive holiday season

Address Verification: Use an address verification system to 
catch and correct errors in customer shipping addresses 
before orders are processed. This reduces the number of 
failed deliveries and ensures that packages reach their desti-
nations on time. Investing in address verification can lead to 
fewer delays, happier customers, and lower costs associated 
with reshipping

Supplier Communication: Maintain ongoing communication 
with your suppliers to stay updated on lead times and poten-
tial disruptions. Regular check-ins help you adjust reorder 
points based on supplier timelines, ensuring you have the 
right amount of stock to meet demand. Clear communication 
with suppliers is key to avoiding last-minute surprises and 
ensuring a smooth supply chain.

Negotiate Supplier Terms: Take this time to renegotiate pay-
ment or shipping terms with your suppliers. For example, you 
might secure extended payment terms to preserve cash flow 
during the busy season or negotiate better shipping rates to 
reduce overall costs. Having favorable terms in place can pro-
vide you with more flexibility and reduce financial strain 
during peak times

Develop Contingency Plans: Prepare contingency plans for 
potential supply chain disruptions, such as delays in 
production or shipping issues. Identify alternative suppliers 
or logistics partners in advance so that you can pivot quickly 
if problems arise. Being prepared for the unexpected 
ensures that your operations can continue smoothly even 
when challenges occur

Preparation Phase
JUN - AUG
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2.

3.
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Preparation Phase
JUN - AUG

5.

6.

7.

8.

Contact Suppliers Early: Reach out to your suppliers as soon 
as possible to secure inventory orders and confirm delivery 
timelines. Early communication ensures that you can adjust 
for potential delays in production or shipping, reducing the 
risk of stockouts during peak season. This proactive approach 
helps maintain a steady supply chain and supports demand 
forecasting.

3PL Discussions: Schedule a meeting with your 3PL provider 
to discuss your holiday fulfillment needs and assess their sea-
sonal staffing and capacity. This conversation should include 
setting expectations for order volumes, understanding their 
cut-off times for deliveries, and ensuring that they are fully 
equipped to handle your specific requirements. Building a 
strong relationship with your 3PL early can help mitigate 
potential challenges during the peak season

Peak Season Forecasting: Use sales data from previous years 
to forecast demand accurately, allowing you to better plan 
inventory needs and staffing. Sharing these forecasts with 
your fulfillment partners ensures that they are prepared to 
meet your specific demands. A data-driven approach can 
prevent stockouts, reduce excess inventory, and ensure 
smoother operations

Inventory Turnover Management: Assess your current inven-
tory levels and focus on clearing out slow-moving products to 
make room for high-demand items. By aligning your invento-
ry with peak season trends, you can avoid holding onto dead-
stock that ties up capital and warehouse space. Strategic 
inventory management is essential for maintaining cash flow 
and maximizing profitability during the holidays.

Secure Additional Storage Space: Evaluate your current 
warehouse space and secure additional storage if necessary. 
Peak season often requires increased inventory levels, and 
having the proper storage ensures that you can accommo-
date this influx without causing logistical bottlenecks. Renting 
extra space can also help prevent delays in fulfillment due to 
crowded conditions

Staff Training: Begin training your seasonal staff well in 
advance, ensuring they are familiar with your processes and 
ready to handle the busy holiday season. Cross-train your 
existing staff to cover multiple roles, which can increase flexi-
bility and reduce the risk of delays during peak times. Proper 
training helps maintain consistency in order fulfillment and 
customer service, even during high-volume periods

Test Shipping Automations: Implement and thoroughly test 
shipping automation tools, such as auto-label printing or rate 
calculators, to ensure smooth operations during peak times. 
These automations can significantly speed up the shipping 
process, reduce human errors, and help your business 
handle a higher volume of orders efficiently. Testing ahead of 
time allows you to identify and fix any issues before they 
impact peak season operations

Optimize Checkout Process: Ensure that your checkout pro-
cess is streamlined and optimized for the best customer 
experience. Tools like Easyship's Rates at Checkout provide 
accurate shipping options, improving transparency for cus-
tomers and reducing cart abandonment. A smooth checkout 
experience can increase conversion rates, especially during 
the competitive holiday season

Address Verification: Use an address verification system to 
catch and correct errors in customer shipping addresses 
before orders are processed. This reduces the number of 
failed deliveries and ensures that packages reach their desti-
nations on time. Investing in address verification can lead to 
fewer delays, happier customers, and lower costs associated 
with reshipping

Supplier Communication: Maintain ongoing communication 
with your suppliers to stay updated on lead times and poten-
tial disruptions. Regular check-ins help you adjust reorder 
points based on supplier timelines, ensuring you have the 
right amount of stock to meet demand. Clear communication 
with suppliers is key to avoiding last-minute surprises and 
ensuring a smooth supply chain.

Negotiate Supplier Terms: Take this time to renegotiate pay-
ment or shipping terms with your suppliers. For example, you 
might secure extended payment terms to preserve cash flow 
during the busy season or negotiate better shipping rates to 
reduce overall costs. Having favorable terms in place can pro-
vide you with more flexibility and reduce financial strain 
during peak times

Develop Contingency Plans: Prepare contingency plans for 
potential supply chain disruptions, such as delays in 
production or shipping issues. Identify alternative suppliers 
or logistics partners in advance so that you can pivot quickly 
if problems arise. Being prepared for the unexpected 
ensures that your operations can continue smoothly even 
when challenges occur
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Preparation Phase
JUN - AUG

9.

10.

11.

12.

Contact Suppliers Early: Reach out to your suppliers as soon 
as possible to secure inventory orders and confirm delivery 
timelines. Early communication ensures that you can adjust 
for potential delays in production or shipping, reducing the 
risk of stockouts during peak season. This proactive approach 
helps maintain a steady supply chain and supports demand 
forecasting.

3PL Discussions: Schedule a meeting with your 3PL provider 
to discuss your holiday fulfillment needs and assess their sea-
sonal staffing and capacity. This conversation should include 
setting expectations for order volumes, understanding their 
cut-off times for deliveries, and ensuring that they are fully 
equipped to handle your specific requirements. Building a 
strong relationship with your 3PL early can help mitigate 
potential challenges during the peak season

Peak Season Forecasting: Use sales data from previous years 
to forecast demand accurately, allowing you to better plan 
inventory needs and staffing. Sharing these forecasts with 
your fulfillment partners ensures that they are prepared to 
meet your specific demands. A data-driven approach can 
prevent stockouts, reduce excess inventory, and ensure 
smoother operations

Inventory Turnover Management: Assess your current inven-
tory levels and focus on clearing out slow-moving products to 
make room for high-demand items. By aligning your invento-
ry with peak season trends, you can avoid holding onto dead-
stock that ties up capital and warehouse space. Strategic 
inventory management is essential for maintaining cash flow 
and maximizing profitability during the holidays.

Secure Additional Storage Space: Evaluate your current 
warehouse space and secure additional storage if necessary. 
Peak season often requires increased inventory levels, and 
having the proper storage ensures that you can accommo-
date this influx without causing logistical bottlenecks. Renting 
extra space can also help prevent delays in fulfillment due to 
crowded conditions

Staff Training: Begin training your seasonal staff well in 
advance, ensuring they are familiar with your processes and 
ready to handle the busy holiday season. Cross-train your 
existing staff to cover multiple roles, which can increase flexi-
bility and reduce the risk of delays during peak times. Proper 
training helps maintain consistency in order fulfillment and 
customer service, even during high-volume periods

Test Shipping Automations: Implement and thoroughly test 
shipping automation tools, such as auto-label printing or rate 
calculators, to ensure smooth operations during peak times. 
These automations can significantly speed up the shipping 
process, reduce human errors, and help your business 
handle a higher volume of orders efficiently. Testing ahead of 
time allows you to identify and fix any issues before they 
impact peak season operations

Optimize Checkout Process: Ensure that your checkout pro-
cess is streamlined and optimized for the best customer 
experience. Tools like Easyship's Rates at Checkout provide 
accurate shipping options, improving transparency for cus-
tomers and reducing cart abandonment. A smooth checkout 
experience can increase conversion rates, especially during 
the competitive holiday season

Address Verification: Use an address verification system to 
catch and correct errors in customer shipping addresses 
before orders are processed. This reduces the number of 
failed deliveries and ensures that packages reach their desti-
nations on time. Investing in address verification can lead to 
fewer delays, happier customers, and lower costs associated 
with reshipping

Supplier Communication: Maintain ongoing communication 
with your suppliers to stay updated on lead times and poten-
tial disruptions. Regular check-ins help you adjust reorder 
points based on supplier timelines, ensuring you have the 
right amount of stock to meet demand. Clear communication 
with suppliers is key to avoiding last-minute surprises and 
ensuring a smooth supply chain.

Negotiate Supplier Terms: Take this time to renegotiate pay-
ment or shipping terms with your suppliers. For example, you 
might secure extended payment terms to preserve cash flow 
during the busy season or negotiate better shipping rates to 
reduce overall costs. Having favorable terms in place can pro-
vide you with more flexibility and reduce financial strain 
during peak times

Develop Contingency Plans: Prepare contingency plans for 
potential supply chain disruptions, such as delays in 
production or shipping issues. Identify alternative suppliers 
or logistics partners in advance so that you can pivot quickly 
if problems arise. Being prepared for the unexpected 
ensures that your operations can continue smoothly even 
when challenges occur
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Pre-Peak Season
SEPT - OCT

Hire Seasonal Staff: Start interviewing and hiring seasonal 
workers to help manage the anticipated holiday rush. Ensure 
that these employees are trained in your processes and 
equipped to handle increased volumes efficiently. Having a 
well-prepared workforce ensures that your fulfillment 
operations run smoothly even during the busiest times.

Deliver Inventory to 3PL: Coordinate with your 3PL to ensure 
that your inventory is delivered on time for major shopping 
events like Black Friday and Cyber Monday. Make sure to ask 
your 3PL about their inventory receiving deadlines to avoid 
any disruptions. Early deliveries help you stay ahead of the 
curve and ensure product availability during high-demand 
periods

Direct Shipping from Manufacturers: If there are risks of 
inventory delays, consider drop shipping directly from 
manufacturers to customers. This can be a valuable backup 
plan if your regular supply chain is disrupted, ensuring that 
you can still meet customer demands. Direct shipping can 
also reduce fulfillment times for international orders

Plan Marketing Campaigns: Strategize and prepare your 
holiday ad, email, and social media campaigns in advance. 
Effective planning allows you to optimize your messaging, 
timing, and targeting to maximize impact. A well-executed 
marketing campaign can help drive traffic to your website 
and boost sales during peak season

13.

14.

15.

16.
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Pre-Peak Season
SEPT - OCT

17.

18.

19.

20.

Stress Test Website: Perform load testing on your website to 
ensure it can handle the anticipated surge in traffic. This 
includes testing the speed of the site, checkout process, and 
any integrated apps or plugins. Ensuring your site can handle 
peak traffic without crashing or slowing down can prevent 
lost sales and frustrated customers

Enhance Website Security: Update your website's security 
protocols to protect customer data during the holiday shop-
ping season. With increased traffic comes increased risk of 
cyber threats, so make sure your site is secure with SSL certifi-
cates, firewalls, and regular security scans. Keeping your web-
site secure builds trust with customers and protects your busi-
ness from potential liabilities.

Customer Communication Strategy: Develop a communica-
tion plan for keeping customers informed about shipping 
deadlines, promotions, and inventory availability. Clear and 
timely communication reduces confusion and helps set realis-
tic expectations, leading to a better customer experience. 
Use multiple channels such as email, SMS, and social media 
to reach customers effectively.

Mobile Optimization: Ensure your website is fully optimized 
for mobile users, as many customers will be shopping on 
mobile devices during peak season. This includes mo-
bile-friendly navigation, quick loading times, and an easy 
checkout process. Mobile optimization is critical for capturing 
sales from the growing number of mobile shoppers
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Pre-Peak Season
SEPT - OCT

21.

22.

23.

Shipping Supplies Stock-up: Order ample shipping supplies, 
including boxes, tape, labels, and packing materials, well in 
advance of the holiday rush. Running out of shipping sup-
plies during peak season can cause significant delays and 
frustration. A surplus of supplies ensures that your fulfillment 
operations continue smoothly even during the busiest times

Create a Returns Workflow: Establish a streamlined workflow 
for handling returns efficiently. Designate specific staff mem-
bers and space for processing returns, including sorting, 
repackaging, and restocking items. An organized returns pro-
cess can minimize delays, reduce errors, and enhance cus-
tomer satisfaction

Packaging Strategy: Review and update your packaging 
strategy to ensure that products are packed securely and 
attractively. Good packaging can reduce the likelihood of 
damage during transit and enhance the unboxing experience 
for customers. Well-designed packaging also supports your 
brand and adds value to the customer experience
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Peak Season Execution
NOV - DEC

Execute Marketing Campaigns: Launch your planned holi-
day ads, email campaigns, and social media promotions to 
drive traffic and sales. Monitor the performance of your cam-
paigns and make adjustments as needed to optimize results. 
A well-timed marketing push can help maximize your reach 
during the critical shopping days

Free Shipping Promotions: Promote your free shipping offers 
prominently on your website to attract more customers. Free 
shipping is a significant incentive for many shoppers, and 
clearly communicating it can reduce cart abandonment and 
boost conversion rates. Make sure that your free shipping 
promotions are easy to find and understand

Update Returns Policy: Ensure that your return policy is 
updated, clearly communicated, and easy to find on your 
website. Having a well-defined returns process in place helps 
build trust with customers and can make the post-holiday 
return experience smoother for both parties. Offering pre-
paid return labels can further enhance customer satisfaction

Monitor Inventory Closely: Continuously track inventory 
levels and reorder stock as necessary to avoid stockouts. Use 
real-time inventory management tools to stay on top of prod-
uct availability, and be prepared to make quick decisions if 
stock levels start to dwindle. Monitoring inventory closely 
ensures that you can meet demand without overcommitting

24.

25.

27.

26.
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Peak Season Execution
NOV - DEC

28.

29.

31.

30.

Implement Shipping Cutoffs: Stay informed about all holiday 
shipping deadlines from your couriers, and communicate 
these cutoffs to your customers. Make sure your customers 
know when they need to place orders to receive them by 
specific holiday dates. This helps manage customer 
expectations and prevents disappointment due to late 
deliveries

Customer Service Enhancement: Set up an FAQ section, 
implement chatbots, and ensure customer service teams are 
fully trained to handle increased inquiries. Providing quick 
and accurate responses can reduce customer frustration and 
improve their overall experience with your brand. 

Provide Real-Time Tracking: Offer real-time tracking 
information to customers for all orders, which reduces anxiety 
and improves overall satisfaction. Customers expect to be 
able to track their packages from shipment to delivery, so 
ensure your tracking system is integrated seamlessly. A 
branded tracking experience adds professionalism and can 
increase repeat purchase

Offer Multiple Shipping Options: Providing various shipping 
options, such as standard, expedited, or even same-day 
delivery, allows customers to choose the service that best 
meets their needs. Offering flexibility can increase 
conversion rates and improve customer satisfaction, 
particularly during the busy holiday season. Display these 
options clearly at checkout to prevent cart abandonment
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Peak Season Execution
NOV - DEC

32.

33.

35.

34.

Manage Returns Efficiently: An efficient returns process, 
including clear instructions and prepaid return labels, helps 
maintain customer trust and satisfaction. Set up a streamlined 
workflow for processing returns quickly, which can prevent 
delays and reduce the chance of errors. Efficient returns 
management is especially critical during the post-holiday 
season when return volumes peak

Seasonal Promotions: Adjust your promotional offers based 
on real-time performance, considering what is resonating 
most with your audience. Be prepared to pivot strategies if 
necessary, such as increasing discounts on slower-moving 
products or offering flash sales to boost engagement. 
Flexibility in promotions can keep your brand competitive 
and drive sales during key shopping periods

Communicate with Couriers: Stay in close communication 
with your couriers throughout the season to stay updated on 
potential shipping delays or issues. This will allow you to 
inform your customers promptly about any potential impacts 
on delivery times, which can reduce customer complaints 
and enhance transparency. Keeping couriers informed of 
your shipping volumes can also help with smoother 
operations

Monitor Fulfillment Partner Performance: Actively track the 
performance of your 3PL or fulfillment partners, ensuring 
they meet the agreed-upon service levels. If issues arise, 
address them promptly to prevent further disruptions. 
Having regular check-ins and clear communication with your 
fulfillment partners can help maintain smooth operations
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Post-Peak Season
JAN

36.

37.

38.

Prepare for Weather Disruptions: Anticipate weather-related 
disruptions that could impact shipping times, particularly in 
areas prone to inclement weather during the winter. Prepare 
contingency plans for such disruptions, including alternative 
courier services or communication strategies to keep 
customers informed. Proactive planning can mitigate the 
impact of delays on customer satisfaction

Data Analytics Monitoring: Use data analytics tools to track 
performance metrics, including sales, customer 
engagement, and fulfillment efficiency, in real-time. 
Monitoring these data points allows you to make quick, 
informed decisions that can optimize your strategy during 
peak season. Analyzing data effectively can lead to better 
resource allocation and improved overall performance.

Promote Gift Cards: Promote gift cards as an ideal solution 
for last-minute shoppers or for customers affected by 
shipping delays. Gift cards also help increase sales while 
reducing pressure on your fulfillment operations, as they 
require no physical shipping. Additionally, they encourage 
repeat purchases and help build customer loyalty.
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Post-Peak Season
JAN

Analyze Performance Data: Conduct a thorough analysis of 
your peak season performance, looking at metrics such as 
sales, fulfillment accuracy, and customer service 
responsiveness. This analysis will help identify strengths and 
areas for improvement, guiding your strategy for future peak 
seasons. Using performance data is crucial for continuous 
improvement and scaling your operations.

Clearance Sales Planning: Plan and execute post-holiday 
clearance sales to move leftover inventory and make room 
for new products. Clearance sales can help you recover 
capital tied up in unsold stock and attract bargain-hunting 
customers. Use email marketing and social media to 
promote these sales effectively.

Customer Feedback Collection: Collect feedback from 
customers about their holiday shopping experience through 
surveys, reviews, or direct communication. Use this feedback 
to refine your processes, improve customer service, and 
enhance the overall shopping experience. Engaging with 
customers post-purchase shows that you value their input 
and fosters loyalty.

Review Fulfillment Partnerships: Assess the performance of 
your fulfillment partners during peak season and determine 
whether they met your expectations. If necessary, explore 
new fulfillment partners that might better suit your needs for 
future seasons. Continuously evaluating your partnerships 
helps ensure that your fulfillment operations remain efficient 
and reliable.

39.

40.

41.

42.
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Post-Peak Season
JAN

43.

44.

46.

45.

Financial Review: Conduct a financial review to assess the 
profitability of your peak season and identify areas where 
costs could be reduced. Reviewing your expenses, including 
shipping costs, labor, and marketing, can help you optimize 
your budget for future seasons. A financial review also helps 
highlight your most profitable products and sales channels.

Staff Performance Review: Evaluate the performance of your 
seasonal staff, identifying top performers who may be 
retained for future roles or even full-time positions. 
Conducting performance reviews allows you to assess which 
staffing strategies were most effective during peak season. 
Rewarding top performers can boost morale and improve 
retention rates.

Website Maintenance: Perform post-peak maintenance on 
your website, fixing any issues that may have arisen during 
the busy season. This includes addressing any speed, 
security, or user experience problems that could impact 
future sales. Regular maintenance ensures that your website 
remains a reliable platform for ongoing business.

Update Inventory Forecasts: Use the data gathered from 
your peak season to adjust inventory forecasts for the 
upcoming year. Understanding which products performed 
well and which did not can help you make more informed 
purchasing decisions moving forward. Inventory forecasting 
is key to preventing overstocking or stockouts in future peak 
seasons.
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Post-Peak Season
JAN

Supplier Review: Evaluate the performance of your 
suppliers during the peak season and consider 
renegotiating terms or finding alternative suppliers for future 
years. Assessing supplier performance helps ensure that 
your supply chain remains strong and reliable. Good 
supplier relationships are essential for consistent and timely 
inventory replenishment.

Long-Term Marketing Planning: Start planning your 
long-term marketing strategy for the next year, incorporating 
insights from the holiday season. Use data to identify which 
campaigns were most successful and refine your approach 
for the year ahead. A well-planned marketing strategy keeps 
your brand top of mind year-round, not just during the 
holidays.

Evaluate Technology Solutions: Assess the performance of 
any new technology solutions you implemented during peak 
season, such as automation tools or customer service 
platforms. Determine if these tools should be adopted for 
year-round use to improve efficiency. Investing in the right 
technology can give you a competitive edge in a highly 
dynamic market.

Engage with Customers: Send follow-up communications to 
customers, thanking them for their business and offering 
post-holiday promotions or discounts to encourage repeat 
purchases. Personalized communications help maintain 
customer relationships and build loyalty long after the 
holiday season ends. Consider offering loyalty programs or 
exclusive deals to keep customers engaged.

50.

47.

48.

49.
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